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Public Notice

FLEMINGSBURG – Nighttime 
paving work began Wednesday, July 
16, at 7 p.m.  This work is being done 
along two miles of KY 207 (mile-
point 15.59 to milepoint 17.65) and 
runs through Flatwoods in Greenup 
County. Work is scheduled for night-
time hours only, 7 p.m. to 7 a.m., 
Monday through Friday.  Work will 
take place overnight to minimize 
traffic impacts. No lane closures will 
take place after 7 a.m. during day-
time hours. Contractors will be uti-
lizing one lane traffic controlled by 
flaggers. 

Phase 1: Sidewalk ramp recon-
struction to meet ADA requirements 
so intermediate sidewalk closures 

will take place.
Phase 2: Milling of existing as-

phalt and resurfacing. 
This work is expected to take four 

weeks. The state highway improve-
ment project is being done by Moun-
tain Enterprises under a $813,887.50 
Kentucky Transportation Cabinet 
contract.

Road work schedules are subject 
to change depending on weather con-
ditions. Motorists are asked to heed 
all warning signs, slow down in work 
zones, and remain aware of workers 
and construction equipment when 
traveling. For up-to-date traffic infor-
mation, go to goky.ky.gov or use the 
WAZE app.

Work underway on 207


