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105 Public Notices

Richardson, Scotty &
Kathie- No trespassing, 
no hunting, no fishing, 
no 4-wheeling, no 
cutting of timber, no
illegal dumping. Not 
responsible for any
accidents or injuries that 
may occur on properties 
located in Pulaski
County. 8/25

Ritchey Family Irrevo-
cable Trust, Dasen 
and Rebecca Ritchey
No trespassing, no 

hunting, no drones, no 
illegal parking. No fish-
ing no dumping.& no 
cutting of trees. . Not re-
sponsible for accidents 
or injuries on all proper-
ties located in Pulaski 
Co. 10/25
Roaden Odena and
Kettry  Burke and Eliza-
beth Gregory.  No tres-
passing, No hunting, No 
fishing. No illegal dump-
ing. No 4-wheeling. No 
cutting of timber. Not re-
sponsible for accidents 
or injuries on properties 
located in Pulaski Coun-
ty 04-26

Roderick Dale Wilson 
Family Trust-
Posted No Trespassing, 
hunting, camping, fish-
ing, or ATVs and/or 4 
wheeling permitted and 
Not responsible for any 
injuries or accidents on 
all owned property lo-
cated on South Highway 
837, Nancy Ky 42544 
tAll trespassers will be 
prosecuted to the full 
extent of the law. 04/26
Rose, Jack & C.L.- No 
trespassing,No dump-
ing,No drones, No park-
ing. Not responsible for 
accidents or injuries that 
may occur on properties 
in Pulaski Co 05/26
ROY, Kenneth & Karen 
- 924 Clifty Hill Rd. Sci-
ence Hill. No Trespass-
ing, no hunting, no 4-
wheeling, no horse back 
riding. Not responsible 
for any accidents and/or 
injuries that may occur 
on properties located in 
Pulaski County. 9/25
Sparrow, Brenda & Ja-
mie. No trespassing, no 
hunting, no 4-wheeling, 
no cutting of timber. No 
illegal dumping. Not re-
sponsible for any acci-

dents or injuries on 
properties located in Pu-

laski County 01/26
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Salter, Jeffrey and De-
nise. No trespassing, no 
vehicles bikes or 4-
wheelers of any kind al-
lowed on property. No 
hunting, no cutting of 
timber, no illegal dump-
ing, no camping. Not lia-
ble for any accidents or 
injuries that may occur 
on properties located in 
Pulaski Co 06-26

Sander, John and Mel-
anie. No trespassing, 
No hunting. No fishing. 
No illegal dumping. No 
4-wheeling. No cutting 
of timber. Not responsi-
ble for accidents or inju-
ries on all properties lo-
cated in Pulaski Co 03-
26
SHELTON, Lynnville & 
Linda - No trespassing, 
no hunting, no fishing, 
no 4-wheeling, no cut-
ting of timber, no illegal 
dumping. Not responsi-
ble for any accident or 
injuries that may occur 
on properties located in 
Pulaski County. 03/26
SINGLETON, James C.
No trespassing, no 
hunting, no fishing. Not 
responsible for acci-
dents or injuries that 
may occur on property 
located in Pulaski 
County. (North Hwy E 
70 & Hwy 27 Eubank 
Area) 02/26

Smith, Muriel
No trespassing, no 
hunting, no ATVʼs not 
responsible for any acci-
dents or injuries on any 
property located in Pu-
laski Co . Violators will 
be prosecuted. 10/25
SRN Enterprises-No 
trespassing, no hunt-
ing, no fishing. Not re-
sponsible for any acci-
dents or injuries that 
may occur on properties 
located in Pulaski Co. 
All previously granted 
permissions revoked.
11/25

Stepp, John & Julie. 
No trespassing. Not re-
sponsible for any acci-
dents or injuries that 
may occur on property 
located in Pulaski Co 
12/25
Stout, James G & De-
bra- No trespassing, no 
hunting, no ATVs. Not 
responsible for acci-
dents or injuries on 
properties located in Pu-
laski Co 10/25
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STIGALL, Beverly - No 
trespassing, no hunting, 
no 4-wheeling, no cut-
ting of timber, no illegal 
dumping. Not responsi-
ble for any accidents or 
injuries on properties lo-
cated in Pulaski County. 
(806 Bullock Ln. & 350 
Floydswitch-Estesburg 
Rd in Eubank, KY) 
11/25

Stigall, Edward No
trespassing, no hunting. 
No ATVs. No Horse-
back riding, no cutting of 
timber. Not responsible 
for accidents or injuries  
on properties located in 
Pulaski County 03-26

Stigall, Montie &
Sandra ~ No 
trespassing. no ATVs 
not responsible for 
accidents or injuries on 
all property located in 
Pulaski Co. Violators 
will be prosecuted. 
06/26
Stigall, Montie &
Sandra ~ No 
trespassing. no ATVs 
not responsible for 
accidents or injuries on 
all property located in 
Pulaski Co. Violators 
will be prosecuted. 
06/26
Stout, James & Ash-
ley- No trespassing, no 
hunting, no ATVs.. Not 
responsible for acci-
dents or injuries on 
properties located in Pu-
laski Co. 10/25

The Bottom Inc
Properties on Mofield 
Rd & Oil Center Rd No 
trespassing No hunting, 
No Fishing, No 4-wheel-
ing. Not responsible for 
any accidents or injuries 
that may occur on prop-
erties located in Pulaski 
Co 06/26

The heirs of Dona 
McKee, Wilson-McKee 
Brenda & Jacobs, Ju-
dy-,Brian McKee
No trespassing, no 
hunting, no ATVʼs, no 
cutting of timber. No 
dumping, no camping, 
no parking. Violators will 
be prosecuted. Not re-
sponsible for accidents 
and injuries on any 
properties located in Pu-
laski Co. 6/26
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VANHOOK FARM 
Property on Piney 
Grove Rd #1 -No driving 
or parking on Vanhook 
property, No trespass-
ing No off road vehicles, 
no hunting without writte
permission. Not 
responsible for any
accidents or injuries that 
may occur on properties 
located in Pulaski Co, 
Violators will be prose-
cuted to the fullest.
Property is well posted. 
03/26

Virgina B Floyd Family 
Limited Partnership- 
630 Walter Floyd RD. 
Eubank KY ~ No tres-
passing, No cutting of 
timber, No hunting, No 
fishing, No motorized 
vehicles on property. 
Not responsible for any 
accidents or injuries on 
any and all properties 
owned in 
Pulaski County. 10/25

WEDDLE, Gary D. -
3536 S. Hwy 837, Ingle-
Nancy. No trespassing, 
no hunting, no 
fishing,no cutting of tim-
ber.  no 4-wheeling, no 
firearms. Not
responsible for any
accidents or injuries that 
may occur on owned 
properties in Pulaski 
County. 03/26

WEDDLE, Ronald -
Property located on 
Dixon Rd. off of Piney
Grove Rd, in Nancy.
No trespassing, No 
hunting, no 4-wheelers 
Not responsible for any 
accidents or injuries that 
may occur on properties 
located in Pulaski Co. 
08/25

WEDDLE, Ronda and 
Bradshaw, Matthew & 
Robin ~ No
trespassing, no hunting, 
no fishing, no 
4-wheeling, no 
digging.No cutting tim-
ber No dumping No 
placement of anything 
without permission. Not 
responsible for
accidents or injuries that 
may occur on any or all 
properties located in
Pulaski and Casey 
Counties 06/26
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WEDDLE, T.M.
No parking no trespass-
ing not responsible for 
accidents property in 
Pulaski County corner o 
hwy 80 and Lane Town 
Road 10/25

WELLS, Arthur - 
Property located on 
1301 East Old Norwood 
Rd, Science Hill, KY.
No trespassing, no 4-
wheeling, no hunting, no 
fishing, no horseback 
riding, no camping.
Not responsible for any 
injuries or accidents that 
may occur on properties 
located in Pulaski 
County. 12/25

Wesley, Anna NO 
TRESPASSING ANY
AND ALL PROPERTY 
No Hunting fishing cut-
ting of timber trespass-
ing of any kind no place-
ment of anything unless 
permission is given. Not 
responsible for acci-
dents and injuries., vio-
laters will be prosecuted 
08/26

Wesley, Danny & Iva-
dean, Heirs of Benny 
Sweet- No trespassing, 
not responsible foracci-
dents or injuries on any 
properties located in Pu-
laski Co 5/26

Wesley, K.W. and C.J. 
Isaacs -576 West Farm 
Rd, Nancy Ky ~
No trespassing, no 
hunting, no fishing, no 
4-wheeling, no cutting of 
timber, no illegal 
dumping, no camping. 
Not responsible for any 
accidents or injuries in 
Pulaski County. 5/26

WHITAKER, Carl G. & 
Anna - No trespassing, 
no hunting, no 4-wheel-
ing. Not responsible for 
any accidents or injuries 
that may occur on all 
properties located in 
Pulaski County. 12/26

Whittle, James and 
Whittle, Noel
No trespassing, no 
hunting, no 4-wheeling. 
Not responsible for any 
accidents or injuries on 
properties located in Pu-
laski Co. 10/25
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ZUMBIEL, William & 
Rose - No trespassing, 
no hunting, no fishing, 
no cutting of timber, no 
4-wheeling, no dump-
ing. Not responsible for 
any accidents or injuries 
that may occur on prop-
erties located in Pulaski 
Co. 3/26

147 Legals

The following will be 
sold for towing and 

storage fees by Yan-
ders Towing, 134 Super 
Service Dr, Somerset  
Ky 42501 606-875-
1093 on 09/15/25

2015 Dodge Journey 
VIN 

3C4PDCBG7FT535837
License 920 RYW

Last known owner/ad-
dres David Pratt, Eu-

bank KY

155 Lost & Found

$1000 Reward
Lost parrot she flew off 
behind the house in Kol-

sons  Landing, other 
subdivisions near are 
Lake Forrest and Hori-

zon Hills 
She has a distinctive 

parrot squawk 
CASH REWARD, NO 
QUESTIONS ASKED! 
573-528-7425 or 573-

528-7423
225 General Help Wanted

Epperson Air Condi-
tioning, Heating, 

Plumbing and Electric 
is searching for quali-

fied employees. 
Salesperson, 

operations manager, 
mechanical engineer,
electrician, hvac me-
chanic and plumber. 

Employment available 
immediately.

Go to web page
eppersoninc.com or
contact office at 112 
West University Dr, 

Somerset, KY 42503
606-679-7476

390 Yard & Garage Sales

Yard Sale Fri & Sat 
8 am to 2 pm 

@ 430 Summershade 
Dr.

Furniture, tires, house-
hold items, ladies cloth-
ing (small/med). Design-

er shoes (size 8) and 
purses.  Thirty one totes 
and much much more!
No early birds please

Large Community 
Yard Sale

Southern Hills Estate

off of Parkers Mill Rd 
On Friday 8/1 and Sat 

8/2 8am to 3pm
follow yellow arrow 

signs to reach each
yard sale

Yard sale
Thurs 7/31, Fri 8/1 & 
Sat 8/2 from 8am to 

2pm
at 134 Palm Circle, 

Somerset, KY 42501 
(village Green Subdivi-

sion)
Clothes, kids/baby 

items, toys, home items 
and much more!

All clothes $3 or less!!
Great deals!!

Garage Sale
Thurs 5pm to 7pm, Fri 
& Sat from 8am to 6pm
64 Muirfield Dr, Saddle-
brook Sub. Across from 
Hal Rogers Fire training 

Center.
Antique & modern pic-

ture frames. Lots of 

390 Yard & Garage Sales

household decor, 
Christmas decor, Elec-

tric blanket, ladies 
clothes (size M). Blue & 
white comforter set, vin-
tage vases & pottery, 12 

place setting, stone-
ware, antique small ta-
bles and much more!

BIG YARD SALE-2
family

Fri, Aug 1st & Sat Aug 
2nd 8am - ?

1304 Jims Dr off of Oak-
hill Rd turn onto Holly 

Hills Rd
We have a little bit of 
everything, furniture 
(bunkbed) twin beds 

and a dresser, womens 
clothes (2xl) and shoes, 
yard decorations, horse 

decor and more
Please look for signs.

605 Real Estate Rent

FOR RENT
3 Br 2 ba with a back 
deck in a great neigh-

borhood  
No smoking, small pet 
considered for more in-

formation call
606-802-6059

610 Homes for Rent

Brand new 1 bedroom 
house.with nice yard.

Retired and elderly
preferred. New Washer, 
dryer, stove and refrig-

erator included.
606-872-5555 


