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105 Public Notices

Stigall, Montie &
Sandra ~ No 
trespassing. no ATVs 
not responsible for 
accidents or injuries on 
all property located in 
Pulaski Co. Violators 
will be prosecuted. 
06/25

The heirs of Dona 
McKee, Wilson-McKee 
Brenda & Jacobs, Ju-
dy-,Brian McKee
No trespassing, no 
hunting, no ATVʼs, no 
cutting of timber. No 
dumping, no camping, 
no parking. Violators will 
be prosecuted. Not re-
sponsible for accidents 
and injuries on any 
properties located in Pu-
laski Co. 6/25

147 Legals

1986 Citation Capri
I/O

Vin: KYZ13864C121
Mechanicʼs lien sale.
Engine is bad and boat 

is in rough shape 
comes with trailer.
Owner: Tom Phelps. 

Selling/repair business: 
Sprague Marine and 
Performance LLC

38 Todd Ave. Eubank, 
KY 42567

Call 606-775-0329 Poor 
condition $500 OBO (or 

best offer)

155 Lost & Found

$500 Reward
Lost parrot she flew off 
behind the house in Kol-
sons  Landing, other 
subdivisions near are 
Lake Forrest and Hori-

zon Hills 
She has a distinctive 

parrot squawk 
CASH REWARD, NO 
QUESTIONS ASKED! 

605 Real Estate Rent

Office space available
downtown.

205 E Mt Vernon St  
800-900 sq feet. 
Call 606-875-7486

660 Townhouses/Condos
Rent

FOR RENT Furnished 
(optional)  2 bd 1 bth 

Condo in Gated 
WOODSON BEND RE-
SORT, with 24 hrs se-
curity. gated communi-
ty!  Second floor unit 

with screened in porch, 
Fireplace, Sun deck,& 
Patio. Stainless steel 
appliances, large kitch-
en. Golf course access, 
Swimming Pool, and 

Tennis Courts. Covered 
Golf Cart storage and a 
small storage unit,. 

Wash and Dryer in unit. 
Water,& Condo feeʼs in-
cluded, Small Pet con-
sidered. One year lease 

@ $1495.month & 
$1000 deposit.Short 

term rentals considered 
but prefer 1 year lease 
For more info call or 
text 513-235-0535.  

Email 
steveawinter@gmail.co
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