
Frank Swift is at home here
suffering from a severely
bruised shoulder, back and
arm which he sustained in an
automobile accident Aug. 14.

Swift was traveling near
Pineville when he skidded on a
wet road which was covered
with fresh oil.

Six boys from Anderson
County are among the 20 men
who will report from the Local
Board NO. 89 composed of
Shelby, Anderson and Oldham
counties.

The local boys are Joe Colvin
Ockerman, Thomas Vernon
Brown, Henry Moore, Jr., Sid-
ney Ward Gill, and Roy Vernon
Thurman, Anderson County.

Quality Court subdivision
sold at public auction Wednes-
day by the Humson Realty Co.
The plot, consisting of 2.8 acres
at the end of Chautauqua
street brought $9,315. Buyers
included Dr. J.B. Lyen, Mrs.
Mabel Williams, Wm. T. Carey,
O.V. McGuffey and Miss Euith
Crossfield.

The Garett Johnson apart-
ment house on Woodford
Street sold Wednesday by the
Taylor-Downs Realty Co. to
Adis Davenport.

Sam Smith, member of the
Junior Conservation Club here,
won first place and a silver
medal in the State finals in Rifle
and Moskeet shoot held at the
Franklin County Sportsmen’s
Club firing range near Frank-
fort. Smith was entered in the
plinker rifle (open sight) divi-
sion. He was also the runner-up
in the single shot Junior Rifle
Division.

Mrs. Ben R. Bond underwent
an operation at the Frankfort
Hospital and is at home
recovering satisfactorily. Mrs.
Ellis Collins has been ill at her
home for several days with an
infection. She is reported as
improved.

Mrs. Will Dedman has been
confined at her home on
Woodford street for the past
week suffering from a heart
condition.

Miss Nince Neal, who has
been ill at her home with virus
pneumonia for the past two
weeks, is reported as much
better.

1950
Swift in Accident

Six to Leave

Real Estate

First Place

Illnesses

Mrs. W.B. Clark is ill at the
King’s Daughters hospital in
Frankfort.

Miss Jean Cox of Lawrence-
burg visited Miss Patsy
Boggess last week.

Miss Kitty Boggins and Jane
Warford visited at Salvisa last
week.

Mrs. Claude Sparrow spent
last week with Mr. and Mrs.
Clarence Chapman in Mercer
Co.

Mrs. Congo Finney of Shelby
County spent Sunday with Mr.
and Mrs. Lisco Beasley.

Mr. James Albert Sanders
has been ill at his home here.

Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Herndon
were afternoon guests of Mrs.
Vege Perry.

Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Taylor
and Virginia spent Sunday
evening with Mr. and Mrs. John
Taylor of Kirkland.

Mrs. L.P. Gritton is very ill.
 

A public hearing preceded
the City Council meeting Mon-
day night at which time Attor-
ney Walter Patrick explained to
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the council about the area of
3.31 acres of land, owned by
H.N. Edmondson in Hilltop
Plaza, and his request for its
rezoning from residential 2 to
business 1 status. The Planning
and Zoning Commission went
into special session and after a
short time recommended to
the council that the plot of land
be rezoned and the council
voted its approval.

Greg Higgins, son of State
Trooper and Mrs. Leslie Higgins
and Buster Watts, son of Mr.
and Mrs. Paul Watts left Tues-
day for Snead State Junior Col-
lege in Boaz, Alabama.

Larry Lynn, son of Mr. and
Mrs. George Lynn has entered
the University of Kentucky
Dental School for the present
school term. He is a graduate of
Anderson County High School.

An ancient medical device
purchased recently by Mrs.
Clyde Haley at an antique auc-
tion near Georgetown, has
been identified by a local
physician as probably being a
stomach pump of early vin-
tage. It may be seen in the
Anderson New’s Window.

City Street foreman, Robert
Cook, said that he received a
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call in the early morning that a
considerable amount of glass
was on Broadway between
Chilton’s Furniture Store and
Jakes Parkette. Cook said he
spent from 5 to 6 a.m. remov-
ing broken beer and soft drink
bottles form the street.

Mr. and Mrs. Leroy Tingle
and Greg visited Mrs. Pearl
Keeling over the weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. Clifton Nutgrass
and family were the Sunday
dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs.
James Helmburg.

Mr. and Mrs. Reeves Gregory
and Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Baxter
spent from Saturday until Mon-
day at their trailer on Beaver
Lake.

Kelia and Michael visited
Regina and Lisa Champion
Monday evening. They spent
the day Tuesday with Susan
and Jason Woodside.

Mr. and Mrs. Brack Hardin
were treated to supper by Mr.
and Mrs. Thomas Catlett one
night last week at the Ruritan
Club. The occasion was Mr.
Hardin’s birthday.

Mr. Raymond Carlton is still
recuperating satisfactorily at
his home after recently under-
going surgery on his knee. He
is able to be up without
crutches and is permitted by
his doctor to return to light
duties.
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Brad Briscoe announced
Monday night that he will no
longer volunteer as a trainer for
the Anderson County High
School football team.

Speaking of mayhem – she’d
never come out and say so, but
my suspicion is Superinten-
dent Sheila Mitchell is falling
on the sword over the Brad
Briscoe dustup that spiraled
nearly out of control over the
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past two weeks. In a statement
she released Monday, Mitchell
said the district made an
“effort” to reach out to Briscoe
after it signed a contract with a
certified athletic trainer. Briscoe
said he never heard from any-
one and found out by reading
“The Anderson News.”

The fourth annual Seth Car-
nahan Memorial Bowl is sched-
uled for next when the Ander-
son County Middle School
football team will host North
Pulaski at the Anderson County
High School field. The game is
dedicated to the memory of
Seth Carnahan, an Anderson
County Middle School player
who drowned while playing
with a friend in Elkhorn Creek
Aug. 1, 2009. He was 13 years
old.

Carnahan Bowl
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